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Variant vowels and 
diphthongs (-oi, 
-ou).
“ -oi in boy” /ɔi/
“-ou in goat” /oʊ/
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Voz en on Música de entrada 1

Teacher: Toe
PCV: Toe

Teacher: Join
PCV: Join

Teacher: Boat
PCV: Boat

Teacher: Avoid
PCV: Avoid

Teacher: Coast
PCV: Coast

Teacher: Spoil
PCV: Spoil

Voz on

Articulation To produce the /-oi/ sound you 
need to glide your lips from a 
tense oval shape to a calm slightly 
parted position, your jaw must rise 
with your tongue and close.Yyour 
tongue must glide from a low 
position to a high position near the 
roof of the mouth. 

To produce the /oʊ/ sound your 
lips must be tense and very 
rounded, your jaw should rise 
with your tongue close a bit, and 
your tongue should glide from the 
midlevel to a point near the roof of 
your mouth.

Voz on 4
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Practice /
Production

1-Work in pairs and pronounce the 
following words: 
Foil, Nose, Coin, Roam, Avoid, 
Loan

2-Write a sentence with each of 
the previous words (Foil, Nose, 
Coin, Roam, Avoid, Loan). 

3-Then, record them on your cell 
phone or your classmate’s cell 
phone. 

Voz off Se presenta la 
primera instrucción

Se presenta la 
segunda instrucción

Se presenta la 
tercera instrucción
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